
SABINE COIJNTY PROPOSAL PACKET FORM (Road Material)
JANUARY 1,2024 T]NTIL DECEMBER 31,2024

BIDFORM
MATERJAL OBTAINED ON

Site Location: Jasper Plant, 641E Milam, Jasper Tx 75951

Glauconite Road Base (3 x 5 ): S No Bid ton

Glauconite Rock : S No Bid ton

vard

1x3

yard

S 41.00 ton yaxl

$ No Bid An lJgrd

$ an vord

$ 52.50 b vqfr

$ 52.50 ton yard

$ 123.38 ton

S ton

Cold Laid Asphak s 110.25 ton

ASPPI\4 s 169.81 ton

Oil Sand $ 84.46 ton

ALL MATERIATS USED INEACHPRODUCT MUST COMPLYWTTH STATE & FEDERAL
EN\,'IRONT4ENTAL LAWS AND REGUALATIONS.
SABINE COI,]NTY WILL NOT BE OBLIGATED TO PURCHASE ANY PARTICT]LAR QUA}ITITY OF

PRODUCT DURING THE BID PERIOD,

Certified weight tickets indicating gross weight on each load must be provided with every
invoice. Any and all pn:posals shall be provided on this sheet.

Sabine County raerves the ight a accept or tqiect any or all proposals

DATE: December 15,2023 FIRM: Texas Materiats

NAME: Cote parmer ADDRESS: 204 E Burke Ave, Lufkin Tx 75901

6^et o,=PHONE NUMBER: 936-366-9045

U

u"t /'fi page //D

Limestone Base :

FilterRock(2x4):

Rt>Ran(4x6):
3X5

Hot futxed Asphah

$ ton

Bidder Initial CP





SABINE COIINTY PROPOSAL PACKET FORM (Road Material)
JANUARY 1,2024 UNTIL DECEMBER 31,2024

BIDFORM
SPECIFICATIONS AIID PROPOSAL FOR ROAD NIATERIAL OBTAII[ED ON SITE:

Site Location: Rebecca Yard , 8670 State Highway 103, Bronson Tx 75930

Limestone Base : 41.00

tifter Rock (2 x 4)

RipRap (4 x O:

3X5

$ No Bid toz vard

ton

52.50

S 52.50 ton ysrd

$ No Bid ton

ton

S ton

Cold Laitl Aspholt $ No Bid tan

$ t0n

$ ton

ALL MATERTAIS USED IN EACTIPRODUCT MUST COMPLYWITH STAIE & FEDERAL

ENVIROM\4ENTAL LAWS AND REGUALATIONS.

SABINE COI]NTY WILL NOT BE OBLIGATED TO PURCHASE ANYPARTICUI.A,R QUANTITY OF

PRODUCT DURING TIIE BID PERIOD.

Certified weight tickets indicating gross weight on each load must be provided with every'
invoice. Any and all proposals shall be provided on this sheet.

Sabine County ra*ves the right to accept or rejecl any or all proposals

DAfEi December 15,2023 FIRM: Texas Materia

NAME: Cole parmer ADDRESS: 204 E Burke Ave, Lufkin Tx 75901

PHO\E NUMBER: 936-366-904s

S

vor 43 t-,"1!/.

I

GlauconiG Road Base (3x5): W
Glauconitp Rod< : $ No Bid /or yard

t $ lon vod

Hot Mlxed Asphatt

I

Bidder Initial CP





SABINE COUNTY PROPOSAL PACKET FORM (Road Msterial)
JANUARY 1 , 2024 TINTIL DECEMBER 3 I ,2024

BIDFORM
SPECIFICATIONS AND PROFOSAL FOR ROAD MATERIAL OBTAINED ON SITE:

Site Location: Texas l\ilaterials center Plant

Glauconitc Road Basc x5 yard

Glauconite Rock : s ton yanl

S - tot, _ _)arn

Limestone Base : S ton yard

$ ton

FilterRock(2x4):

RipRap(4xO: $ ton wrd

S ton vY$d

s ton vard

$ ton

ton

Cokl l-aid Awhalt $ ton

Type D H[.4C1 $ 128.93 ton

S 110.51 ton

ALL MATERIATS USED IN EACH PRODUCT MUST COMPLYWITH STATE & FEDER.AL

ENVIRONMENTAI, LAWS AND REGUALATIONS.

SABINE COTJNTY WILL NOT BE OBLIGATED TO PURCHASE ANY PARTICULAR QUANTTIY OF

PRODUCT DURING THE BID PERIOD.

Certified weight tickets indicating gross weight on each load must be provided with every
invoice. Any and all proposals shall be provided on this sheet.

Sabine Courty raemes the right to accept or rejea any or all proposals,

DATE: 12-11-23 FIRM: Texas Materials

NAME: Cole Parmer ADDRESS: 204 E Burke St.

PHONENIIMBER: 936-366-9045

S

w,o'-

vot 4 /p^s.J/A

Hot Mixed Asphak

Tvoe D Hot Mix ,$ 132.86 ton

Oil Sand

Lufkin Tx 75901

Bidder Initial CP



TEXAS
UATENIALS

Customer No:

lnvoice No:
lnv Date:
Page:

Customer PO:

235671

201263567

1',t t27123

Page 1 of 1

PO#14615
PO Bot I51705
Luftin, TX 75915

/,,, )
,w,/,

County of Sabine

PO Box 597
H€mphill TX 75948

T€xas Materials - Easl Texas Ar€a

PO Box 15'1705
Lulkin. TX 75915
936-639-2215

sabcotreas@co.sabine-tx.us

Delivered To: Alljobs not quoted SABINE COUNTY

oato Ticket# Product, oescription QTY UI\4 Unil Prlce MatlTolal Tax Total

Plant:00143 Stone - ETX Rebecca Yormlnal

JOB #/ Pol / P0#14615

IIATERIAL: Texas Crushed Slono - Feld - LS. TXDOT G

11/2723 1430071s1 032703 .Wgtrgle;r"r"Ls
11127n3 143007155 032703 Texas Crushed Stone- Feld-LS.

TTOOT G

1127,23 143007159 032703 T6xas Crushed Slone . Feld - LS-

TTDOIG

1r.31

11_22

11.29

TON

TON

TON

38.50

38.50

38.50

435.44

431.97

4U.67

135.44

431.97

13,{.67

0.00

0.00

0.00
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